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Welcome to the latest edition of Active Silicon bulletins, our News Focus. We’ve 
compiled some of our most interesting recent news posts to keep you up to date 
with developments from us, and from the wider vision industry.  
   

  
 

 

 

Technology in farming is getting fishy  

Fish farming is facing unprecedented 
challenges as demand for food grows 
while global supplies are impacted by 
over-fishing, increased regulation and 
environmental degradation. Read more 
about the solutions that vision technology 
has to offer. 

 

Read more > 

 

  
 

 

Active Silicon expands 
We've opened our new production and 
operations facility in Langley, UK. The 
additional capacity of this extra facility will 
allow us to meet recent increased demand 
more efficiently. Find out more about 
Active Silicon and how we operate on our 
About Us page. 

 

Read more > 
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UKIVA's Machine Vision Conference  

UKIVA staged their industry conference 
in Milton Keynes, UK, on 6th June this 
year, and we enjoyed being part of it. We 
gave a presentation on HD digital video 
transmission as well as displaying our 
computer vision products, you can read 
more about our demo in our news story. 

 

Read more > 

 

  
 

 

It's farming, but not as we know it  

Agriculture 4.0, Farming 4.0, AgriTech 
and Smart Farming are all recognized 
terms being used to refer to the adoption 
of advanced technology to improve yields 
and feed the world. We look at some of 
the options being developed by Tech 
companies large and small. 

 

Read more > 

 

  
 

 

When computer vision blends physics 
with biology...  

Nature really is amazing, and bio-inspired 
technology is now looking to encompass 
characteristics found in birds, insects and 
sea creatures to enhance artificial vision. 
Read our story to understand more about 
these exciting developments. 

 

Read more > 
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Another successful Machine Vision 
Roadshow  

On 17th May, the 2019 Machine Vision 
Roadshow truck closed its doors for the 
last time this year. We’ve enjoyed meeting 
all the engineers and system developers 
who came to share knowledge and learn 
from our industry experts. View event 
photos on our Instagram page. 

 

Read more > 

 

  

 

Active Silicon is a leading manufacturer of imaging products, embedded systems and 

custom solutions. If you would like to stay informed of upcoming events, products and 

news in general, then please follow us on one of our social media channels below.  
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